BILL OF MATERIALS- Bid No. RPU-2016660-EXHIBIT A, REVISION ONE Requisition No. Y206787

RTRP: RIVERSIDE 69kV TRANSMISSION LINE BUILD, PHASE | (RERC-HARVEY LYNN)

SCOTT MFG &

ORDER | ORDER UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT
CITY STOCK # PART DESCRIPTION MF MFG CATALOG NO. TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE/EA | TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE |UNIT PRICE/EA| TOTAL PRICE
Qry. UNIT sc g S Sl 2 9Ll PRICE/EA o ¢ / PRICE/EA PRICE PRICE/EA /

TERMINAL, PIN, 1/0 ALUM., COMPRESSION BY TINNED ANNEALED COPPER BAR,

20281 >0 A" lhomac #Usu10, NO suB. HOMAC usul1o $1.88 $94.00 $1.99 $75.62 s0.00|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GRIP, CABLE RISER, FOR 4" CONDUIT, FOR 1 5/8" TO 2 1/2" DIAMETER CABLE,

20646 18 BA ewss LR-4-1.62, NO SUB LEWIS LR-4-162 $38.67 $696.06 $48.60 $874.80, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $43.20 $777.60
GRIP, CABLE RISER, FOR 5" CONDUIT, FOR 3/12" TO 4 1/2" DIAMETER CABLE, LEWIS

20650 7 EA lyir-5350, No SUB LEWIS LR-5-350 $51.79 $362.53 $63.50 $444.50 $0.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54.74 $383.18
TERMINATOR, COLD SHRINK, FOR #2-1/0 ALUM, JACKETED CABLE. 3M QTIII #7652-S

20776 38 EA 141/0-10. NO sUB. 3M 7652-5-4-1/0-10 $43.86 $1,666.68 $48.00 $1,824.00 $0.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50.40 $1,915.20
CHANNEL, 8", BACK TO BACK, 15/8" X 15/8" X 8" 14 GAUGE GALV., WITH 1/2"-13 X
15/16" HEX HEAD CAP SCREW AND SHORT SPRING CLAMPING NUT 1/2"-13,

20846 170 A |pACKED 25 EA. PER BOX. WESANCO #501 OR APPROVED EQUAL. W1008C-8" OR WESANCO
KUMAR #N-1008-C-8". W501SSPG10 $2.75 $467.50 $11.88 $2,019.60) $14.50| $2,465.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

21401 200 EA  |CLAMP, WEDGE, ALUMINUM, SMALL, BLACKBURN #W62-1 OR APPROVED EQUAL. BLACKBURN W62-1 $0.99 $198.00, $1.08 $183.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

21450 175 EA CLAMP, HOT TAP, 2/0- 1/0, BLACKBURN #PGH29 OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL. BLACKBURN PGH29 $21.59 $3,778.25 $23.65 $4,020.50) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
CLAMP, HOT TAP, BLACKBURN PGH49 OR APPROVED EQUAL, #4 - 450kcmil Main,

21451 175 EA BLACKBURN PGH49
#6 - 4/0 Tap $20.59 $3,603.25] $22.50 $3,825.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CLAMP, PIPE, 4", WITH BOLT AND NUT, WESANCO PART #W-6154, TOLCO #RIGID

21477 120 EA" 140 KUMAR #N-2154. WESANCO  (W-6145 $1.43 $171.60 $1.60 $192.00 $1.55|  $186.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CLAMP, PIPE, 5", WITH BOLT AND NUT, WESANCO PART #W-6162 OR KUMAR PART

21478 24 EA lyna162. WESANCO  (W-6162 $1.60 $38.40 $1.76 $42.24 $2.25|  $54.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CONDUIT, 4" PVC, SCH. 80, IN 10 FT. LENGTHS, COMPLETE WITH BELLED END OR

21730 190 EA |ONE COUPLING PER LENGTH. CANTEX SCH80-4-10 $2.41 $457.90 $2.72 $516.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CONDUIT, 5", PVC, SCH. 80, IN 10FT. LENGTHS, COMPLETE WITH BELLED END OR

21731 100 EA" | ONE COUPLING PER LENGTH. CANTEX SCH80-5-10 $3.51 $351.00) $3.89 $389.00 $0.00]  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

22020 50 EA  |CONNECTOR, WIRE, SPLIT BOLT, FOR 1/0 COPPER, BURNDY #KS25 NO SUB BURNDY KS25 $1.73 $86.50| $2.42 $60.50| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.33 $58.25

22027 75 EA CONNECTOR, SPLIT BOLT TYPE - 4/0, COPPER BLACKBURN #30H, NO SUB. BLACKBURN 30H $6.26 $469.50 $6.86 $480.20, $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00

22033 50 EA CONNECTOR, WIRE, FOR 4/0 ACSR, MEDIUM, FARGO #GA9040-GL, NO SUB. FARGO GA9040-GL $9.40 $470.00 $11.70 $585.00] $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00

22038 100 EA PARALLEL GROOVE CLAMP, #2 - 500, CAD PLATED ALUM HUBBELL # ATC 1343 HUBBELL ATC1343 $18.99 $1,899.00 $20.76 $2,076.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00

22045 40 EA CONNECTOR, GROUNDING, 3 SOLID TO 4/0 STR FARGO #GC-209 FARGO GC-209 $10.95 $438.00 $15.25 $610.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00

22057 50 EA  |CONNECTOR,AA 397.5 MAX, 4/0MIN, LARGE, FARGO #GA9400-GL, NO SUB. FARGO GA9400-GL $12.71 $635.50 $15.10 $120.80, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
CONNECTOR, WIRE, 4/0 TO #6 SOLID CU., RUN SIZE 397.5 TO 4/0, LG-MED, FARGO

22058 75 EA FARGO GA9401-GL
#GA9401-GL, NO SUB $12.70 $952.50 $15.10 $1,057.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CONNECTOR, 1/0 TO #6 STR., SMALL, FARGO #GA9020-GL,NEW # GA9020GLSS

22060 100 EA ’ ’ ’ ’ FARGO GA9020GLSS
2/11/04 NO SUB $4.92 $492.00 $6.00 $300.00, $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
INSULATOR, SINGLE SMALL SPOOL RACK, GRAY W/CLEVIS, PRE-ASSEMBLED, JOSLYN

22306 300 EA" lujp 4011086 W/197, COOPER DC3F65, KORTICK K9102. JOSLYN JP-4001108G $6.03 $1,809.00] $7.45 $2,235.00) $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
INSULATOR, GUY STRAIN, LARGE SKY GLAZE, CLASS 54-3, VICTOR 506 OR CITY

22308 32 EA ’ ’ ’ ’ MCLEAN L506
APPROVED EQUAL. $5.30 $169.60 $6.06 $109.08| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

22327 150 EA  [SPACER, TRIPLEX CABLE, PLASTIC, SCOTT ENGINEERING # S-4386 SCOTT ENGINEERING|S-4386 $13.71 $2,056.50 $14.75 $2,212.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

22333 150 EA DEADEND, FOR 4/0 ACSR, PREFORMED #DG4547, NO SUB PLP DG4547 $5.10 $765.00 $5.25 $787.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00

23004 1500 EA  |WIRE, GUY, 7/16", EXTRA HIGH STRENGTH, IN 200 FT. HAND COILS, GRADE "B" NATIONAL STRAND [716EHSGSA250C $0.45 $675.00 $0.72 $936.00] $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
WIRE, 1/0-19 STRAND COPPER, THHN, BLACK, 1000 FT. PER NON-RETURNABLE

23061 500 FT  |REEL, MUST BE ON REEL, REEL MUST CONTAIN GROSS, TARE & NET WEIGHT, ON SOUTHWIRE 20505402
NON-RETURNABLE REEL SIZE 24" X 18" X 12", $1.35 $675.00, $1.54 $539.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Luminaire, LED, 2700K, 6652 Lumen, Type 2, 100-277VAC, 55W, 0-10V Dimming, 7-

10013282 20 EA pin receptacle, City Roadway Luminaire Type LF-S2, Solar Max # SMX-55Wie-NV- HOWARD LGHT LRS1DMV23KGY1P7N
LV2-2770-T202-P P02 $126.82 $2,536.40 $158.00 $3,160.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Luminaire, LED, 3000K, 18624 Lumen, Type 3, 100-277VAC, 153W, 0-10V Dimming,
10018283 20 EA 7-pin receptacle, City Roadway Luminaire Type LF-L3, Solar Max # SMX-150WiE-NV- HOWARD LGHT LRM1VMV23KGY1P7

LV2-3070-T302-P N $198.87 $3,977.40 $203.00 $4,060.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, 316 STAINLESS STEEL, 1/2"-13 X 1 1/2" HEX HEAD CAP, WITHOUT NUTS, 50

23500 40 EA lper Box WINZER 070.12.112 $0.83 $33.20 $0.96 $38.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, MACHINE, 3/8" X 5", SQUARE HEAD WITH SQUARE NUT, HOT DIPPED

23523 30 EA GALVANIZED,JOSLYN J8605 OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL, KORTICK K1005. JOSLYN 18605 $0.61 $18.30, $0.86 $25.80, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, MACHINE, 3/4" X 18", SQUARE HEAD WITH SQUARE NUT, HEAVY DIPPED

23552 75 EA  |GALVANIZED, HUGHES BROTHERS # B718-6, JOSLYN J8918, KORTICK K1318 OR CITY JOSLYN 18918
APPROVED EQUAL. $2.78 $208.50 $4.33 $259.80, $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.65 $219.00




BOLT, MACHINE, 3/4" X 16", SQUARE HEAD WITH SQUARE NUT, HEAVY DIPPED

23562 50 EA JOSLYN 18916
GALVANIZED, KORTICK K1316. $2.83 $141.50 $3.18 $133.56| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, SPACING, 5/8" X 20", HOT DIPPED, GALV, DOUBLE ARMING, JOSLYN J8870,
23564 2 EA" |cOOPER #DF2D20, KORTICK K1370 OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL. 10SLYN 18870 $2.59 $64.75 $2.99 $14.95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.28 $41.40
23585 50 EA  |EYENUT, THIMBLE TYPE, 3/4" GALV., JOSLYN J6511. JOSYLN 16511
/ $2.90 $145.00 $3.50 $52.50, $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23588 20 EA SCREW,CAP HEX HEAD 1/2" X 13 X 1+1/2" ZINC PLATED (IN BOXES OF 50). WINZER 075.12.112 $0.33 $6.60 $0.96 $19.20, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
BRACE, CROSSARM, 32",FLAT, GALV., ONE 9/16" AND ONE 7/16" HOLE 30" O.C., IN
23810 40 EA  |BUNDLES OF 20 EACH, JOSLYN #)7132 OR APPROVED EQUAL INWESCO # 40A16, JOSLYN 17132
A.B.CHANCE 7132 $3.76 $150.40 $6.76 $216.32 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.09 $226.88
53916 37 A |BRACKET, TERMINATOR MOUNTING, FOR 1/0, F/USE ON CROSSARMS, W/COLD M MB-4
SHRINK TERMINATOR. 3M #MB-4, OR EQUAL i $13.49 $499.13 $14.50 $536.50, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $15.01 $555.37
53917 4 A |BRACKET, TERMINATOR MOUNTING, FOR 750 MCM, F/USE ON CROSSARMS, M MB-6
W/COLD SHRINK TERMINATOR. 3M #MB-6 NO SUB. B $34.62 $138.48 $36.50 $146.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $39.77 $159.08
BRACKET, ADAPTER POTHEAD/ARRESTER HOT DIP GALVANIZED, SCOTT
23923 13 EA SCOTT ENGINEERING|ES-52AB
ENGINEERING #ES-52-AB OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL $92.58 $1,203.54 $97.85 $1,272.05 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SCREW, LAG, 3/8" X 2 1/2", SQUARE HEAD, JOSLYN #18742 1/2 OR APPROVED
24153 500 EA JOSLYN 18742-1/2
EQUAL. (MUST BE GALVANIZED) COOPER DF6L250 / $0.47 $236.50 $0.65 $234.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SCREW, LAG, 1/2" X 4", GALV., WITH SPIRAL TYPE THREAD, WITH PILOT POINT.
24155 60 EA  |(MUST HAVE APPROX. 45 DEG. SPIRAL TYPE THREAD), JOSLYN #I8754TP OR JOSLYN 18754TP
APPROVED EQUAL, CHANCE 508500 $0.62 $37.20 $0.72 $43.20 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.97 $58.20
RACK, SECONDARY, 3 SPOOL, WITHOUT GRAY INSULATORS, JOSLYN #)1268
24401 75 EA ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ JOSLYN 1768
CHANCE C207-0052 OR #1768. STD. PK 5 EA. $26.10 $1,957.50] $36.50 $2,737.50) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $36.73 $2,754.75
ARM, MAST, 2" X 8', ALUMINUM, UNBRACED, FOR WOOD POLES, JOSLYN #751008
24756 20 EA " or saLco #wp-2-8- SALCO WP-2-8-A $87.09 $1,741.80) $95.20 $1,904.00 $0.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ARM, MAST, 2" X 14', FOR WOOD POLES, WITH 2 REINFORCING RODS, P/N WPDG-2-
24759 20 EA ias auminum SALCO WPDG-2-14-5 $227.96 $4,559.20) $249.00 $4,980.00 $0.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
LAMP, HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM, CLEAR, 200 WATTS, 100 VOLTS, ANSI CODE S66,
26073 20 EA BURN ANY POSITION OR BASE DOWN, SYLVANIA #67576-2, LU200. HOWARD LGHT 1LU200 $6.50 $130.00 $15.00 $300.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $7.00 $140.00
26436 40 EA LOCKWASHER, 316 STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 1/2" BOLT, PACKAGED 50 EA. PER BOX. WINZER 448.12 $0.26 $10.40 $0.37 $14.80, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
WASHER, LOCK, 3/4", DOUBLE COIL SPRING, GALV, ELECTRIC MATERIALS TYPE M-
26442 500 EA  |W, JOSLYN #J178, HUBBELL POWER SYSTEMS # C205-0187, HUGHES BROTHERS # JOSLYN 1178
SLW2-70. $0.32 $160.00 $0.77 $292.60| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
STAPLE, ZINC PLATED, 3" X 1 1/16" X 1/4", NO CEMENT COATING, A.B. CHANCE
26450 1000 EA  [47522 OR APPROVED EQUAL 100/BOX JOSLYN J128 $0.26 $260.00 $0.59 $306.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.43 $223.60
STRAP, PIPE 1" WITH TWO (2) - 3/16" HOLES, ZINC PLATED, BOWERS #THS23-1,
26467 600 EA DOTTIE HW403
STEEL CITY HS903, DOTTIE HW403. $0.16 $96.00 $0.20 $112.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
26478 40 EA NUT, 316 STAINLESS STEEL, 1/2"-13, 3/4" ACROSS FLATS, PACKAGED 50 PER BOX. WINZER 339.12 $0.28 $11.20 $0.44 $17.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SWITCH, DISCONNECT, 600 AMP., 15 KV, 110KVBIL, W/2 BOLT TERMINAL CLAMPS,
CONVENTIONAL TYPE, WITH LOADBUSTER ATTACH., ONE LONG BACK BRACE AND
26500 3 EA  |CARRIAGE BOLTS OF MIN. LENGTH OF 7". MCGRAW EDISON FW74D14 OR HUBBELL M3D-66BP
APPROVED EQUAL. HUBBLE CHANCE #M3D-62BP - (PORCELAIN INSULATORS),
HUBBLE CHANCE #M3D-66BP - (POLYMER INSULATORS). $176.08 $528.24 $277.70 $833.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $213.77 $641.31
SWITCH, VACUUM TYPE, 200 AMP, 15.5 KV, 110 BIL, USED FOR CAPACITOR BANK
26513 2 EA  |SWITCHING, STANDARD CONFIGURATION, WITH 5-CONDUCTOR RECEPTACLE, MAYSTEEL 33247501
MAYSTEEL TRINETICS ULTRA VAC, ULTRA 15 #33247501. $1,334.36, $2,668.72, $1,356.00 $2,712.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,410.18, $2,820.36
SWITCH, 15KV, 110KV BIL, 630A CONTINUOUS AND 900A INTERRUPTING RATING,
GANG OPERATED, AIR INSULATED, RECIPROCATING LOADBREAK, HORIZONTAL
CONFIGURATION, 10 FT STEEL BASE WITH PROVISIONS FOR A 4th WIRE, REVERSE
LOOP SILVER PLATED COPPER CONTACTS, 6 EACH HUBBELL/CHANCE ATC1343
26517 10 EA TERMINALS, FIBERGLASS INTERFACE ROD. SWITCH TO HAVE ALL FIBERGLASS INERTIA ENG. L19SL5HG1123F13
OPERATING RODS, SILICONE INSULATORS. PER CITY OF RIVERSIDE SPECIFICATION
NO. 1-3.16 REV2, INERTIA ENGINEERING# L19SLSHG1123F13 OR COOPER POWER
SYTEMS M-FORCE. $3,849.24 $38,492.40) $3,873.00 $38,730.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,111.69 $41,116.90
GUARD-GUY, 8 FT. LENGTH, YELLOW, FOR 5/16" OR 7/16" GUY WIRE, PLASTIC,
26891 > EA " |pREFORMED #PG-5718 OR FWC #FW5718, NO SUB. PLP PG5718 $3.22 $16.10| $3.55 $17.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
FITTING, FOR SIDEWALK GUY WIRE, 2" & 2 1/2" POLE PLATE, 2 PC., CONSISTS OF 1
26901 1 EA EA. JOSLYN #J-0521 AND 1 EA. JOSLYN #)-0522 JOSLYN 10522/10521 $32.10 $32.10 $34.80 $34.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
HOOK, GUY ATTACHMENT, 3/4" BOLT HOLE, A B CHANCE #GH61LS, NO SUB
26906 25 EA / HUBBELL ~ |GHGILS $4.58 $114.50 $4.99 $19.96 $0.00]  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ARRESTER, LIGHTNING 9 KV, 95KV, BIL DIRECT CONNECT MOV, COOPER VARISTAR
29902 36 EA  |#, JOSLYN NO ZHP009-0C00000, PART #8360471, OR TYCO PART#DAH-09A-EODOB1- JOSLYN ZHP009-0C00000
I $38.67 $1,392.12 $41.00 $1,476.00] $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00!
CLAMP, GROUND, BRONZE, FOR 5/8" GROUND ROD, RANGE #4 SOL - 2/0 STR.,
10011923 28 A |5URNDY NO. GAR6426 OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL. BURNDY GAR6426 $6.65 $186.20 $18.89 $528.92 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.23 $510.44
4 EA  |ANCHOR, MANTA-RAY, DRIVEN, MODEL MR-1, 40K ULT. GALV MACLEAN 20036-UT-I $41.69 $166.76 $52.00 $208.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 EA ANCHOR ROD, DRIVE STEEL SECTION, 1-INCH DIAM. 36K ULT., 7.0FT LENGTH MACLEAN D100 $19.47 $155.76 $22.00 $176.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 EA  |ANCHOR ROD, DRIVE STEEL SECTION, 1-INCH DIAM. 36K ULT., 3.5FT LENGTH MACLEAN D100 31/2 $20.10 $160.80 $22.00 $176.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28.60 $228.80




ANCHOR, EYENUT FOR ROD, TWIN-EYE
25 EA MACLEAN D6562A $7.27 $181.75 $8.25 $33.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
c | o | e o s cur s s i ousn
Y ' $33.71 $337.10 $36.50 $146.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10011794 12 EA STRAIGHT BOLT/CABLE TO FLAT TERMINAL LUG TYCO/RAYCHEM |GHVT-693-SSG $2,180.85| $26,170.20, $2,330.00 $27,960.00] $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00 $2,329.55 $27,954.60
- 12 EA |69 KV TERMINATION BRACKET TYCO/RAYCHEM |EHVT-BP $163.62 $1,963.44 $181.00 $2,172.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00, $174.77 $2,097.24
- 36 EA CABLE GRIP, CLOSED SIDE WITH SINGLE EYE, 1750 KCMIL LEWIS OE-350-SW $38.68 $1,392.48 $42.50 $1,530.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $40.88 $1,471.68
- 12 EA CONNECTOR, BOLTED TAP LUG TERMINAL HUBBELL TLD92L $66.49 $797.88 $78.00 $936.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $70.27 $843.24
- 12 EA CABLE GRIP, CLOSED SIDE WITH SINGLE EYE, 250 KCMIL LEWIS OE-112-SW $17.52 $210.24 $19.00 $228.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
SHACKLE, ANCHOR, 7/8" OPENING, 2-3/4" LONG, 5/8" PIN & COTTER, 30K ULT.
24003 40 EA oAy, MACLEAN  [ASH-55 $5.48 $219.20 $7.15 $286.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.68 $747.20
26340 16 EA WASHER, FLAT, 1/2" WINZER 408.01.12 $0.15 $2.40 $0.27 $4.32 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23499 16 EA BOLT, 1/2" X 1" WITH NUT WINZER 075.04.12.1 $0.62 $9.92 $1.76 $28.16) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CONNECTOR, GROUND, FIG "C", COMPRESSION TYPE, 3/0-250 TO 3/0-250,
22074 4 EA PARALLEL GROOVE HYTAP, PREFILLED WITH PNENTROX AND STRIP SEALED. BURNDY YGHC29C29 $6.91 $27.64 $12.35 $49.40 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $11.90 $47.60
26446 1000 EA  |WASHER, FLAT, ROUND, FOR 5/8" BOLT, GALV. JOSLYN 11088 $0.22 $220.00 $0.25 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
INSULATOR, DEAD END 15 KV W/HUMP BACK COTTER PINNED CLEVIS PIN.
22311 30 EA lsiucone MACLEAN D5-15M $9.80 $294.00 $10.45 $313.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $12.48 $374.40
CLAMP, INSULATOR, TIE TOP WIRE, SIZE .25 -.80, INSULATOR NECK SIZE 2.50 - 3.00,
21452 42 EA " lror#2-336.4 ACSR LINDSEY 1204 $39.78 $1,670.76 $42.90 $1,801.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
21437 75 EA  |CLAMP, HOT LINE DEADEND, FOR 1/0-336.4 ACSR, NATIONAL TYPE MACLEAN ASO-684-1 $9.22 $691.50 $10.55 $633.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $16.14 $968.40
- 175 EA BONDING CLIP, 5/8", GALV., WITH SR.NUT HUGHES 2727.6 $1.25 $218.75 $1.25 $218.75 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
26445 150 EA  |WASHER, CURVED 3" X 3", SQUARE, 1/4" THICK, 3/4" HOLE GALV. JOSLYN 16823 $0.77 $115.50 $0.99 $148.50, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
26434 750 EA  |WASHER, LOCK, 5/8", DOUBLE COIL SPRING, GALV. JOSLYN 1177 5017 $127.50 $0.19 $76.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 50 EA  |BOLT, MACHINE, 5/8" X 12", SQUARE HEAD WITH NUT, GALV JOSLYN 18812 $1.20 $60.00 $8.25 $247.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 50 EA  |BOLT, MACHINE, 5/8" X 14", SQUARE HEAD WITH NUT, GALV JOSLYN 18814 §1.35 $67.50 $8.82 $264.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $11.36 $340.80
- 50 EA BOLT, MACHINE, 5/8" X 16", SQUARE HEAD WITH NUT, GALV JOSLYN 8816 $2.03 $101.50 $9.42 $282.60 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00 $12.13 $363.90
31962 1 EA NAIL, CONCRETE 9G, 5/16" X 2", CORE HARDENED 1ST QUALITY WINZER 999.991.101 $0.00 $122.69 $4.25 $10,625.00] $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
DEAD-END, FIBER OPTIC, FOR 96 CT FIBER ADSS LOW TENSION/SHORT SPANS,
22347 7> EA 0.578-0.613" DIAMETER RANGE, WITH RODS AND THIMBLE PLP 2872007 C1E1 $36.10 $2,707.50) $39.50 $2,291.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CLAMP, FIBER OPTIC TANGENT, FOR 96 CT. FIBER ADSS,0.576-0.625" DIAMETER
21405 40 EA RANGE, ALUMINUM PLP FAS #3450102 $27.85 $1,114.00] $30.50 $1,159.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 100 EA  |WASHER, CURVED, 3" X 3", SQUARE, 1/4" THICK, 5/8" HOLE GALV. JOSLYN J113 $0.94 $93.50, $1.00 $60.00| $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
29831 100 EA LINK, FORGED, HOT DIPPED GALVANIZED, 1/2" END LINK MACLEAN CL-4 $4.20 $420.00 $5.35 $214.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23511 10 EA  [NUT, SQUARE, 5/8", GALV, FOR USE WITH 5/8" SQUARE HEAD BOLTS JOSLYN 18563 $0.30 $3.00 $0.35 $3.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
total $125,054.92 total $144,167.98 N/A N/A N/A
+ 8.75% tax $10,942.31|+ 8.75% tax $12,614.70

$135,997.23

$156,782.68




BILL OF MATERIALS- Bid No. RPU-2016660-EXHIBIT A, REVISION ONE Requisition No. Y206788

RTRP: RIVERSIDE 69kV TRANSMISSION LINE BUILD, PHASE | (RERC-HARVEY LYNN)

SCOTT MFG &

ONESOURCE QUOTE AWARD ENG.
ORDER ORDER MFG CATALOG UNIT UNIT TOTAL TOTAL
CITY STOCK # PART DESCRIPTION MFG UNIT PRICE/EA| TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE/EA UNIT PRICE/EA| TOTAL PRICE
Qry. UNIT NO. / PRICE/EA PRICE/EA PRICE / PRICE /
TERMINATOR, FOR 750-1000 MCM AL 15 KV 95 BIL SINGLE CONDUCTOR STRANDED ALUM. XLPE
20784 3 EA" 3w Qr 1 #7655-5-4 . NO SUB. 3M 7655-5-4 $80.78 $242.34]  $78.00 $234.00 $0.00|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $90.06 $270.18
21041 1200 FT CABLE, #12-2 W/GROUND, COPPER, SOLID, TYPE NM, (250 FT. PER ROLL). SOUTHWIRE 13055901 $0.28 $336.00 $0.25 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CLIP, POTHEAD, JOSLYN CAT. NO. CD135-A, FOR USE WITH JOSLYN 25KV "EASY-ON" TERMINAL
21997 8 EA " |oN J-5203-Ms BRACKET. JOSLYN 19203-MS $0.00 s0.00  $18.00 $144.00 $0.00]  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CLAMP, PARALLEL GROOVE, SINGLE BOLT, 3/0 -397.5 ACSR OR 3/0 - 400 STRANDED ALUM AND #6|
22068 8 EA  |-2/0 ACSR OR #6 - 3/0 STRANDED ALUM, PREFILLED, WITH PROTECTIVE COVER, ALCOA #392.6P ALCOA 392.6P
ORT & B #PAE3921-79-2. NO SUB. $3.26 $26.08 $3.00 $24.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.92 $31.36
WIRE, 2/0-19 STRAND COPPER, THHN, BLACK, ON NON- RETURNABLE REELS, MUST BE 19
23062 200 FT  |STRAND, 500 FT/REEL ALL REELS MUST HAVE: GROSS WT., TARE WT., NET WT., CABLE LENGTH SOUTHWIRE 20506299
AND P.O. NUMBER $1.99 $398.00 $1.88 $376.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00! $0.00 $0.00
WIRE, #8 STRANDED COPPER, THHN-THWN, WHITE, 500 FT. PER REEL, ALL REELS MUST HAVE:
23091 50 FT  |GROSS, TARE & NET WT., CABLE LENGTH AND P.0. NUMBER, REELS NOT TO EXCEED 11 1/2" HIGH SOUTHWIRE 20489199
X71/2"WIDE. $0.52 $25.80 $0.28 $14.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COVER, BOLT, GRAY, LIMITED PLASTIC #LPM-1, PATTON PRODUCTS #BC101G OR CITY APPROVED
23610 100 FA lequaL PATTON PRODUCTS  |BC101G $2.77 $277.00 $1.79 $179.00 $0.00]  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23912 44 EA BRACKET, CABLE TERMINAL, ARM MOUNTING JOSLYN #9201-E6, NEW NO. J26725 JOSLYN 126725 $18.70 $822.80 $10.45 $459.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BRACKET, POTHEAD WITH INSULATING BLOCK, HOT DIP, GALVANIZED, SCOTT ENGINEERING, ES-
23915 19 EA |52 OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL, INWESCO 46 AOL. SCOTT ENGINEERING |ES-52 $231.45|  $4:397.55|  $97.85 $1,859.15 $0.00|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23939 18 EA  |BRACKET, TRANSFORMER LEAD, JOSLYN #JP40310, KORTICK #K4587. OBSOLETE NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $899.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23943 4 EA BRACKET, MOUNTING, TWO TRANSFORMER, JOSLYN #JP40526 OR EQUAL, KORTICK #K8351 OBSOLETE NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $54.00 $216.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ASSEMBLY, 3 TRANSFORMER MOUNTING BRACKET, ASSEMBLED, ALUM-FORM #12 MG39, NO
23955 6 EA s ALUMAFORM  |12-MG39 $446.23|  $2,677.38|  $425.00 $2,550.00 $0.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $518.75 $3,112.50
24402 75 EA  |RACK, SECONDARY, 4 SPOOL, JOSLYN #J769 WITH 4 EA. #)101 GRAY INSULATORS. JOSLYN 1769 $52.28 $3,921.00 $40.50 $3,037.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CUTOUT, 200 AMP, HEAVY DUTY, 7.2KV, W/EXPENDABLE 12,000 AMP. INTER. CAP., BLUE
24900 24 EA  |W/LOADBREAK HOOK AND LOADBUSTER OPERABLE - ABB TYPE ICX #X1NCBNKA21, S&C TYPE XS # HUBBELL C710-143PB
89071R11CD, CHANCE TYPE C #C710-143PB $116.51 $2,796.24 $95.20 $2,284.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $126.11 $3,026.64
CONTROL, PHOTO ELECTRIC, 105-305 VAC, 1000W, PER CITY OF RIVERSIDE SPECIFICATION NO. 1- HI-LL-127-15-
25041 48 A |6.3 NEW PART DARK TO LIGHT # DE124-1.0T) ( BLUE COLOR) HOWARD LGHT BU-A $11.78 $565.44 $6.71 $322.08 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
25685 12 EA FUSELINK, 100 AMP, POSITROL, S&C 100 QR CATALOG #338100 OR COOPER #6427-2T. S&C 338100R1 $10.99 $131.88 $7.29 $87.48 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $16.65 $199.80
25689 27 EA FUSE LINK, 200 AMP POSITROL, S&C 200 QR CATALOG #355200 S&C 355200R1 $27.85 $751.95 $27.75 $749.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $42.15 $1,138.05
LAMP, HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM, 100 WATT, 55 VOLT ANSI CODE #554, BURN ANY POSITION OR
26087 20 EA BASE DOWN, LU100, SYLVANIA #67514-3, G.E. #44037. HOWARD LGHT LU100 $5.35 $107.00 $4.65 $93.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.27 $165.40
26419 25 EA  |WASHER, REDUCING 1 1/4"TO 1" NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.75 $18.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00! $0.00 $0.00
26447 360 EA  |WASHER, FLAT, ROUND, 3/8", GALV., MUST BE HEAVY DIPPED GALV. ONLY, IN BOXES OF 200 EA. WINZER 408.01.38 $0.07 $25.20 $0.06 $21.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
26904 20 Ea  |GRIP. GUY WIRE, PREFORMED, FOR 7/16" HIGH STRENGTH GUY WIRE, PREFORMED #GDE-1108, PLP GDE-1108
HUBBELL #FWDE1108 OR APPROVED EQUAL, FOR USE WITH GRADE B GUY WIRE $4.16 $291.20 $4.09 $286.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.42 $309.40
31979 5 LB NAIL, ROOFING, #11 X 2" LENGTH, GALVANIZED. MUST HAVE MIN. 7/16" DIA. HEAD. NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $12.00 $60.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
X25-12-120A 24 EA  |TRANSFORMER, 1-PHASE, POLE, 25 KVA, 12000-120/240 V NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $821.00 $19,704.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
X50-12-120A 10 EA TRANSFORMER, 1-PHASE, POLE, 50 KVA, 12000-120/240 V NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00] $1,110.00 $11,100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
X75-15-120A 2 EA TRANSFORMER, 1-PHASE, POLE, 75 KVA, 12000-120/240 V NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00] $1,625.00 $3,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
12 EA  |ANCHOR, COUPLER FOR 1-INCH DRIVE STEEL MACLEAN D354 $9.58 $114.96 $4.25 $51.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 EA  |POLE BAND, HEAVY DUTY, 7/8' THRUBOLT ASSEMBLED, FOR 9"-12" POLE DIAM HUGHES 3108.6 $101.55 $304.65 $95.00 $285.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 3 EA POLE BAND, HEAVY DUTY, 7/8' THRUBOLT ASSEMBLED, FOR 11"-14" POLE DIAM HUGHES 3108.7 $105.35 $316.05 $98.00 $294.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 A |BONDING CLIP, WITH CARRIAGE BOLT, NUT AND LOCKNUT, MAX 7/16" WIRE DIAM, FOR HUGHES 9718.55
BONDING TO POLE BAND SECTION ’ $2.45 $7.35 $2.36 $7.08 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10000050 16 EA  [SPLIT LOCK WASHER, 1/2" HUBBELL C205-0185 $0.29 $4.64 $0.17 $2.72 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00! $0.00 $0.00
25976 25 EA GROUND ROD, COPPER, 5/8" X 8' ERICO 61588 $12.92 $323.00 $10.15 $253.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $11.29 $282.25
- 23 EA  |LINKS, BENT, 3/8"x3"x9-1/2", 45KIP RATING PER PAIR, GALV. HUGHES 3160 $10.02 $230.46 $9.69 $222.87 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PIN, LONG SHANK, 5/8"X6.5", FORGED STEEL, GALV, 1" NYLON ALLOY THREAD, ANSI CLASS 55-6,
24357 40 EA" W/ sq. NUT AND LOCKWASHER JOSLYN 12072 $5.18 $207.20 $4.72 $188.80 $0.00|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23906 21 EA  |CROSSARM, 10' REGULAR, 4 3/4" X 3 3/4", PENTA TREATED, PRE-DRILLED PER CO-129 BROOKS CIRI $104.20 $2,188.20 $72.75 $1,527.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
20063 8 EA  |FAULTED CIRCUIT INDICATOR, SELF POWERED ELECTRONIC HOT-STICK MOUNTABLE POWER DELIVERY  |41-2001-201 $317.76 $2,542.08]  $299.00 $2,392.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00! $0.00 $0.00
BRACKET, TRANSFORMER MOUNT, SINGLE UNIT UP TO 100KVA, ALUM FRAME W/ 5/8" GALV
5 EA " " " MACLEAN MTB5M1-6
STUD-BOLT HARDWARE, 12" OR 24" BOLT SPACING, FOR USE W/ 3/4" MOUNTING BOLT $0.00 $0.00 $87.90 $439.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1 A |BRACKET, TRANSFORMER MOUNT, DOUBLE UNIT UP TO 50KVA, ALUM FRAME W/ 5/8" GALV MACLEAN MDM-2M2
STUD-BOLT HARDWARE, 12" BOLT SPACING, FOR USE W/ 5/8" MOUNTING BOLT i $0.00 $0.00 $50.50 $50.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CABLE STORAGE, FIBER OPTIC, FIBERLIGN CLAS STORAGE, FOR ADSS CABLE, UNI-GROUP CABLE
- 20 EA louioe PREFORMED  1710012375U $90.26|  $1,805.20]  $87.99 $1,759.80 $0.00]  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 20 EA LOCKNUT, CONCAVE MF, 5/8", GALV MACLEAN 18583 $0.34 $6.80 $0.32 $6.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
total | $25,843.45 $55,750.98
$4,878.21 N/A N/A N/A
N/A - different material items
/ $60,629.19




BILL OF MATERIALS- Bid No. RPU-2016660-EXHIBIT A, REVISION ONE

Requisition No. Y206789

RTRP: RIVERSIDE 69kV TRANSMISSION LINE BUILD, PHASE | (RERC-HARVEY LYNN)

SCOTT MFG & ENG. QUOTE AWARD
ORDER ORDER UNIT TOTAL
CITY STOCK # PART DESCRIPTION MFG MFG CATALOG NO. JUNIT PRICE/EA| TOTAL PRICE |UNIT PRICE/EA| TOTAL PRICE
QTy. UNIT / / PRICE/EA PRICE
10013110 2 EA CAP BANK, FULLY ASSEMBLED, 900Kvar SCOTT ENGINEERING $9224-900-12 $21,081.05 $42,162.10 $22,255.00 $44,510.00 $0.00
Plus 8.75% tax $3,689.18|Plus 8.75% tax $3,894.63
total $45,851.28 total $48,404.63

SCOTT MFG
WESCO
& ENG.
UNIT PRICE/EA -IF-’?J(?I: UNIT PRICE/EA| TOTAL PRICE
$0.00 $0.00
Plus 8.75% tax $3,337.78
total | $41,483.78




BILL OF MATERIALS- Bid No. RPU-2016660-EXHIBIT A, REVISION ONE

Requisition No. Y206790

RTRP: RIVERSIDE 69kV TRANSMISSION LINE BUILD, PHASE | (RERC-HARVEY LYNN) ONESOURCE SCOTT MFG
ORDER | ORDER UNIT UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT
CITY STOCK # PART DESCRIPTION MFG MFG CATALOG NO. TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Qry. UNIT PRICE/EA PRICE/EA PRICE/EA PRICE PRICE/EA PRICE PRICE/EA
FAULTED CIRCUIT INDICATOR, SELF POWERED ELECTRONIC HOT-STICK MOUNTABLE, 0.30" -
1.25" CONDUCTOR 0.D., 1 PHASE, 100 AMP MIN., AUTO ADJUST LOAD TRACKING W/INRUSH
RESTRAINT, 4 HOURS TIME RESET, MANUAL TEST & RESET BY MAGNET, 500 HOUR CAPACITY
20063 70 A |rOR 4 RED FAULT AND 2 YELLOW LEDS, 4 LITHIUM CELL BATTERIES, WATERPROOF, FOR Use | © O WER DELIVERY 41-2001-201
ON OVERHEAD ENERGIZED CONDUCTOR, MONTH & YEAR MARKED, OLD POWER DELIVERY #
27-0201-000-10004. NEW POWER DELIVERY PART # 41-2001-201. $317.76 $22.243.20  $299.00 $20,930.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CABLE, COPPER, XLP, 1/C 4/0, 600 V, 1000 FEET PER REEL, PER CITY OF RIVERSIDE, PUBLIC
UTILITIES DEPT, ELECTRIC DIVISION SPECIFICATION #1-2.21 DATED JANUARY 24, 1996, 19
21019 50 T |STRAND, XLP ONLY ALL REELS MUST HAVE: GROSS WT., TARE WT., NET WT., CABLE LENGTH SOUTHWIRE 11354833
AND P.O. # $3.56 $178.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CLAMP, PARALLEL GROOVE, SINGLE BOLT, FOR #6 TO 2/0 ACSR OR #6 TO 3/0 STRANDED
22067 400 EA ALCOA 396.6P
ALUMINUM, BOTH GROOVES PREFILLED, W/PROTECTIVE COVER, ALCOA #396.6P NO SUB. $1.52 $608.00 $7.55 $3,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, MACHINE, 5/8" X 12" SQUARE HEAD WITH SQUARE NUT, HEAVY DIPPED GALVANIZED,
23553 150 EA JOSLYN J8812 OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL, COOPER #DF3B12. JOSLYN J8812 $1.20 $180.00 $1.38 $207.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, MACHINE, 5/8" X 16", SQUARE HEAD WITH SQUARE NUT, HEAVY DIPPED GALVANIZED,
23557 >4 BA |KORTICK 1216, JOSLYN J8816, COOPER #DF3B16. JOSLYN 18816 $2.03 $109.62 $1.80 $97.20 $0.00|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BOLT, MACHINE, 5/8" X 18", SQUARE HEAD WITH SQUARE NUT, HEAVY DIPPED GALVANIZED,
23558 >4 EA | josivn sss1s. JOSLYN 18818 $1.94 $104.76 $2.25 $121.50 $0.00|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CUTOUT, 100 AMP FUSE TYPE, HEAVY DUTY, 7.2KV, W/EXPENDABLE 12,000 AMP. INTER.
24901 67 EA  |CAP., BLUE W/LOADBREAK HOOK AND LOADBUSTER OPERABLE - ABB TYPE ICX HUBBELL C710-112PB
#XINCANAA11, S&C TYPE XS # 89021R10CD, CHANCE TYPE C #C710-112PB $71.75 $4,807.25 $69.89 $4,682.63 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WASHER, LOCK, 3/8", DOUBLE COIL SPRING, HOT DIPPED GALVANIZED, JOSLYN # J175,
26438 35 EA |HUBBELL POWER SYSTEMS # C205-0188, HUGHES BROTHERS # SLW2-30. JOSLYN 7 $0.25 $8.75 $0.29 $10.15 $0.00,  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 360 EA  |GROUND CLAMP, TWO CABLES TO FLAT HUBBELL GC143A02
$14.67 $5,281.20 $11.00 $3,960.00 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00]
- 12 EA  |GROUND CLAMP, CABLE TO FLAT HUBBELL GC141A02 $12.05 $144.60 $7.70 $92.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 16 EA  |UNISTRUT, 1-5/8" X 1-5/8" UNISTRUT P1000-EG $0.00 $0.00 $3.15 $50.40 $17.50] $280.00) $0.00 $0.00
CADWELD, EXOTHERMIC, CABLE TO GROUND ROD, 4/0 CU (STRANDED) TO 5/8" GROUND
- 15 EA" |Rop, WELD MAT'L "90" (SEE NOTE 2) ERICO GRC162Q $92.17 $1,382.55|  $88.00 $1,320.00 30,00,  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- 12 EA  |CADWELD, CABLE TO CABLE, 250 to 250. ERICO PCC2V2V $92.17 $1,106.04 $88.00 $1,056.00 $0.00 $0.00, $0.00 $0.00
23022 2600 FT  |WIRE, #4 CU, SOLID BARE, SOFT DRAWN, 200 FT / REEL SOUTHWIRE 10644302
$0.46 $1,196.00 $0.52 $1,352.00 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00,
23028 600 FT  |WIRE, 4/0 CU, 19-STRAND BARE, SOFT DRAWN, 500 FT / REEL. SOUTHWIRE 13673916
$2.33 $1,398.00 $2.64 $1,584.00 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00,
22310 40 EA  |INSULATOR, TOP GROOVE, 13.2 KV, GRAY PORCELAIN, F/NECK ANSI 55-4 VICTOR VI 4606 $4.50 $180.00 $7.55 $302.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
total $38,927.97 total $38,785.28 N/A N/A total $31,221.33
+8.75% tax $3,406.20|+ 8.75% tax $3,393.71 +8.75% tax $2,731.87
$42,334.17 $42,178.99 $33,953.20




Requisition No. Y206791
REQUEST FOR QUOTE- 1750kcm AL 69kV UG CABLE FOR RTRP PROJECT

VENDOR LUMP SUM AMOUNT PLUS TAX TOTALS LEAD TIME
McAvoy-Markham $406,706.40| $35,586.81 $442,293.21 8 weeks
Okonite $460,523.65| $40,295.82 $500,819.47 16 weeks
General Cable $531,825.00| $46,534.69 $578,359.69 16-18 weeks
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