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From: McCoy, Jennifer <JMcCoy@riversideca.gov>  
Sent: Friday, September 11, 2020 10:35 AM 
To: Nicol, Colleen <CNicol@riversideca.gov> 
Cc: Enriquez, Edward <EEnriquez@riversideca.gov>; Arseo, Eva <EArseo@riversideca.gov>; Mercer, Brandon 
<BMercer@riversideca.gov> 
Subject: RE: [External] Questions for the Clerk's Office and Purchasing Dept. 

For	Purchasing:	
0) State	your	qualifications.

a. Jennifer	McCoy	–	Purchasing	Services	Manager	(2	Years,	City	of	Riverside)
i. Purchasing	Division	and	Central	Stores	Division	of	the	Finance	Department
ii. 21+	Years	in	Procurement

1) Which	City	Councilmembers	purchased	City	collateral	(business	cards,	stationary,	etc.)	with	union
bugs	on	them	since	12/17/19?

a. There	were	no	orders	place	for	City	collateral	with	union	bugs	on	them	since	12/17/19.
2) Generally,	around	the	time	of	December	2019,	how	would	the	City	go	about	(the	process)

purchasing	collateral	for	members	of	the	City	Council	without	union	bugs	on	them?
a. The	department	can	place	orders	with	The	Hanigan	Co.	by	calling	or	emailing	the	vendor.

3) How	did	the	City	specifically	go	about	purchasing	these	same	items	after	12/17/19	for
Councilmembers	who	wanted	union	bugs	on	their	collateral?

a. Accounts	payable,	P‐Card	Transactions	and	Personal	Reimbursement	payment	methods	all
confirm	that	there	were	no	orders	placed	for	collateral	with	the	union	bugs	on	them	since
12/17/19.

4) Is	there	a	price	differential	between	purchasing	non‐union	bug	collateral	and	union	bug
collateral?		If	so,	what	was	the	price	differential	for	Councilmember	Plascencia?		If	so,	who	paid	for
this	price	differential?

a. No	information	can	be	provided	for	all	3	questions	on	price	difference	due	to	no	union	bug
collateral	orders	being	placed.

5) To	your	knowledge,	is	this	the	first	time	a	City	Councilmember	has	asked	for	non‐standard	items
(i.e.	things	beside	City	emblems,	logos,	etc.)	on	their	collateral?

a. To	my	knowledge,	standard	items	have	only	been	ordered.

Thanks,	

Jenn McCoy 
Purchasing Manager 
City of Riverside 
Finance Department, Purchasing Division 
Main: 951.826.5660 
Direct: 951.826‐5564 
RiversideCA.gov 



From: Jamie Kovacs
To: McCoy, Jennifer
Subject: RE: Hanigan FW: [External] RE: Copies needed
Date: Thursday, September 10, 2020 3:32:20 PM

Nothing submitted by expense reimbursement. I guess there’s always the possibility that someone
could have purchased on their own and hasn’t submitted for reimbursement…
 
Jamie Kovacs
City of Riverside
Finance, Accounts Payable
Accountspayable@riversideca.gov
Main: 951.826.5454
Direct: 951.826.5247
RiversideCA.gov
 

From: Jamie Kovacs 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 3:25 PM
To: McCoy, Jennifer <JMcCoy@riversideca.gov>
Subject: RE: Hanigan FW: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
That’s everything thru AP. I don’t see anything charged against a P-card. Give me a few minutes to
look thru expense statements, but I don’t recall see anything.
 
Jamie Kovacs
City of Riverside
Finance, Accounts Payable
Accountspayable@riversideca.gov
Main: 951.826.5454
Direct: 951.826.5247
RiversideCA.gov
 

From: McCoy, Jennifer <JMcCoy@riversideca.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 3:19 PM
To: Jamie Kovacs <JKovacs@riversideca.gov>
Subject: RE: Hanigan FW: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Do the Council Members order from somewhere else or with their own $?
 
Jenn McCoy
Purchasing Manager
City of Riverside
Finance Department, Purchasing Division
Main: 951.826.5660
Direct: 951.826-5564
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From: Jamie Kovacs <JKovacs@riversideca.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 3:03 PM
To: McCoy, Jennifer <JMcCoy@riversideca.gov>
Subject: RE: Hanigan FW: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
See attached for the monthly statement, which is what we pay from. We do not receive individual
invoices for the business card/stationary PO.
 
Dec. 2019 is for Council, business cards for S. Garcia.
Feb. 2020 is for Mayor, business cards for E. Coronado and Council, business cards for Lujano.
June 2020 is for Council, envelope and Council, business cards for J. Perry.
Aug 2020 is for Mayor, business cards for Sanchez.
 
Sorry, I had meant to include these on my original email to you.
 
Jamie Kovacs
City of Riverside
Finance, Accounts Payable
Accountspayable@riversideca.gov
Main: 951.826.5454
Direct: 951.826.5247
RiversideCA.gov
 

From: McCoy, Jennifer <JMcCoy@riversideca.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 2:50 PM
To: Jamie Kovacs <JKovacs@riversideca.gov>
Subject: RE: Hanigan FW: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Hi Jamie,
 
I need the corresponding invoices that go along with these.  Did they provide that information?
 
Thanks,
 
Jenn McCoy
Purchasing Manager
City of Riverside
Finance Department, Purchasing Division
Main: 951.826.5660
Direct: 951.826-5564
RiversideCA.gov
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From: Jamie Kovacs <JKovacs@riversideca.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 1:56 PM
To: McCoy, Jennifer <JMcCoy@riversideca.gov>
Subject: Hanigan FW: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Attached are the copies you requested.
 
Jamie Kovacs
City of Riverside
Finance, Accounts Payable
Accountspayable@riversideca.gov
Main: 951.826.5454
Direct: 951.826.5247
RiversideCA.gov
 

From: sruiz@thehanigancompany.com <sruiz@thehanigancompany.com> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 1:00 PM
To: Jamie Kovacs <JKovacs@riversideca.gov>
Cc: 'Suzy Hanigan' <suzyh@thehanigancompany.com>; 'Mike Veleker'
<mveleker@thehanigancompany.com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Hello Jamie,
 
I’ve attached all the orders you requested copies to this email.
 
Thank you,
Sara

Design, Print and Promotional Products
7550 Morris St. Riverside CA. 92503
Toll Free: (800) 843-5825
Phone: (951) 688-9114  Fax: (951) 688-9369
Business Hours: Monday to Friday  8:00 A.M.- 5:00pm
 

From: Suzy Hanigan <suzyh@thehanigancompany.com> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 11:57 AM
To: 'Jamie Kovacs' <JKovacs@riversideca.gov>
Cc: sruiz@thehanigancompany.com
Subject: RE: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Yes, Sarah Ruiz will be sending you copies.
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Suzy
 

From: Jamie Kovacs 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 10:07 AM
To: Suzy Hanigan <suzyh@thehanigancompany.com>
Cc: 'Mike Veleker' <mveleker@thehanigancompany.com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Can we get a copy by email?
 
Jamie Kovacs
City of Riverside
Finance, Accounts Payable
Accountspayable@riversideca.gov
Main: 951.826.5454
Direct: 951.826.5247
RiversideCA.gov
 

From: Suzy Hanigan <suzyh@thehanigancompany.com> 
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 10:03 AM
To: Jamie Kovacs <JKovacs@riversideca.gov>
Cc: 'Mike Veleker' <mveleker@thehanigancompany.com>
Subject: [External] RE: Copies needed
 
Good Morning Jamie:  I now have copies of the business cards/stationary that have requested.  It is
hard to come and see you in person, otherwise, Mike Veleker would like to come and deliver them
personally.
Please let us know how to go forward.
 
Thank you
 
Suzy
 

From: Jamie Kovacs 
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2020 12:20 PM
To: Suzy Hanigan <suzyh@thehanigancompany.com>
Subject: Copies needed
 
Suzy, is it possible to get copies of the business cards/stationary shipped to City Council and Mayor
for each of the attached invoices.
 
Jamie Kovacs
City of Riverside
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Finance, Accounts Payable
Accountspayable@riversideca.gov
Main: 951.826.5454
Direct: 951.826.5247
RiversideCA.gov
 

Protect yourself and those around you. Wear a face covering, stay home,
and avoid gatherings with people outside your household.
RiversideCA.gov/COVID-19
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